
CITY OF CUPERTINO 
NOTICE OF SPECIAL PUBLIC HEARING 
ASA-2012-15, TR-2013-39 
 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that at its meeting on February 25, 2014 the Cupertino City 
Council will consider Application No.: ASA-2012-15; Applicant: Kevin Dare (500 Forbes, 
LLC); Location: Southeast corner Vallco Pkwy and  Finch Avenue; APNs 316-20-085, 316-20-
078, 316-20-079; Subject: Main Street Cupertino; Consider an Architectural and Site approval 
referral from the Design Review Committee to provide clarification and or an amendment to 
Resolution 12-098, Condition 35 as to the role of the Design Review Committee. If the 
resolution is amended, consideration and/or adoption of a new resolution regarding the 
Architectural and Site approval of final refinements to the previously approved Main Street 
Cupertino Project; Environmental Declaration: Exempt; 2. Application No.: TR-2013-39; 
Applicant: Kevin Dare (500 Forbes, LLC); Location: Southeast corner Vallco Pkwy and  Finch 
Avenue; APNs 316-20-085, 316-20-078, 316-20-079; Subject: Main Street Cupertino; Tree 
Removal Permit to allow the removal and replacement of additional trees that are unhealthy or in 
conflict with the utilities/infrastructure for the Main Street Project; Environmental Declaration: 
Exempt; All environmental documents for the described applications are available for public 
review at the Cupertino Community Development Department, 10300 Torre Avenue, Cupertino, 
California, 95014. Council meets at 6:45 p.m., Community Hall Council Chamber, 10350 Torre 
Avenue, Cupertino, California. Interested parties are invited to attend and be heard. If you wish 
to challenge the action of the City Council in court, you may be limited to raising only those 
issues you or someone else raised at the public hearing described in this notice, or in written 
correspondence delivered to the City of Cupertino at, or prior to, the public hearing.  Please note 
that City Council policy is to allow an applicant and groups to speak for 10 minutes and 
individuals to speak for 3 minutes. 
 
CITY OF CUPERTINO 
 
/GRACE SCHMIDT/ 
CITY CLERK  
PUBLISH 2/14/14 


